
A Special Bonus for Rock Bottom Golf Customers!  

Enjoy a subscription to Cigar Aficionado and  

Wine Spectator Magazine! 

Included with your qualifying purchase of $30+ is a bonus subscription to both Cigar Aficionado 
($12 value, 6 issues) and Wine Spectator ($15 value, 15 issues). Recipient must be over 21. You 

will never receive a bill for this bonus and it does not automatically renew. It’s a thank-you 

from us! Please allow 8-10 weeks for delivery of your first issue. Your acceptance of this offer 
authorizes us to provide the publisher with your name and mailing address for fulfillment of the 
magazine. Accepted magazine offer may result in a request for qualifying purchase verification 
from an independent publishing auditing organization. If you wish to forfeit your bonus and 
receive a rebate for the stated value, please print and return this form along with a copy of your 
order confirmation page showing total amount of your qualifying purchase as a proof of purchase 

(must include order #, order date, and total purchase amount) and mail both pieces to:  

Magazine Service Center – Rock Bottom Golf Bonus P.O. Box 251-H, Scarsdale, NY 10583  

Include: 1) a copy of your qualifying order confirmation page 2) completed refund form 
First Name: _____________________ Last Name: ___________________________________ 
Address: _____________________________________________________________________ 
City/State/Zip: _____________________________________ 

Date of Purchase: ________________ Purchase Total: ____________________________  

Magazines(s) to be canceled:___________________________ 

Magazine(s) to be rebated:_____________________________ 

Rebate Amount: $_______ 

Terms & Conditions: Customers must meet and follow all requirements listed in these Terms & 
Conditions to be eligible for a rebate. Requests for rebates and customer service inquiries must be 

made by the person who made the original qualifying purchase. Bonus subscriptions are 
processed only after a qualifying purchase has been met and the magazines have been verified to 
be available. You may request a rebate for the stated value of the magazines by US mail 
postmarked within 30 days of your qualifying purchase. If your merchandise is returned or your 
order is cancelled you will not qualify for a magazine rebate. Once a customer receives a rebate 
they will not be eligible for any future magazines or rebates. Limit 1 rebate per household per 
lifetime. A copy of your order confirmation page showing total purchase in dollars and purchase 
date must be provided along with this fully completed form. Originals submitted will not be 

returned. No liability for late, lost or damaged mail that fails to be delivered to the address stated 
on this form. Incomplete, illegible and duplicate requests will not be processed. We do not notify 
customers if their refund submission has been declined. Failure to submit any of the required 
documents within 30 days of your qualifying purchase will automatically result in an invalid 
submission. Please allow 8-10 weeks for processing and delivery of rebates. Offer available to US 



residents only. Void where prohibited or restricted. Quantities may be limited and offer may be 

withdrawn without notice. Valid while supplies last.  

 
 


